Exhibit H1.
Email chain with Subject Line "Following up from Saturday, could
you pass us the Floors Outlet license info?"



Gmail - Following up from Saturday, could you pass us the Floors Outlet... https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=103ef7b6e2 & view=pt&search=al...

M Gma|l Wilhelmina Randtke <randtke@gmail.com>

Following up from Saturday, could you pass us the Floors Outlet license info?

Brian McDonald <brian@floors-outlet.com> Wed, Jun 29, 2022 at 12:34 PM
To: Wilhelmina Randtke <randtke@gmail.com>

Just touching base to see if you are going to allow us the opportunity to come fix what is wrong with job. We haven't
heard from you in some time and are trying to put a plan together.

Thank you,

Brian McDonald
Owner

Floors Outlet

0 912-225-9911

c 912-243-5477

1267 Northside Drive E
Statesboro, GA 30458

On Fri, Jun 24, 2022 at 8:04 AM Wilhelmina Randtke <randtke@gmail.com> wrote:
Brian,

Thank you for providing a certificate of insurance for your and Floors Outlet's partners.
This helps me to know how much | am gambling if | am required to give Floors Outlet a chance to fix things. | have
had another contractor to see the floor and have contacted others. If it turns out that | am required to give Floors
Outlet the opportunity to complete the work, then | will ask for an updated certificate of insurance as part of that
process.
Once | have a replacement contractor, and a plan, | will be in touch about finances.
As a reminder, you are required to provide the name of all applicable insurers for Floors Outlet related to my
potential claim. For both our reference, the contract was signed April 9, 2022, and your subcontractors were in my
house May 23-30.
-Wilhelmina
On Tue, Jun 21, 2022, 8:34 PM Brian McDonald <brian@floors-outlet.com> wrote:
Wilhelmina,
Per our conversation on Saturday, we tried to contact you via phone about our insurance information. We called
between 12:00pm and 1:00pm as you requested because of your work. We are sending you a COl as an
attachment to this email and would like to speak with you about moving forward. We will try to call you again
tomorrow between the same times.

image0.jpeg

Sent from my iPhone

‘ On Jun 18, 2022, at 1:47 PM, Wilhelmina Randtke <randtke@gmail.com> wrote:

‘ Brian,
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Gmail - Following up from Saturday, could you pass us the Floors Outlet... https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=103ef7b6e2 & view=pt&search=al...

I'm following up on this. You have said you will not address issues nor complete the install. Nevertheless, for
me get the floor corrected by another contractor, my understanding is that | may be required to formally give
you the opportunity to fix problems. Because of the amount of damage done to walls, appliances, kitchen
cabinets, and doors, | want to know what insurance coverage you have so that | know how much | am gambling
if you send subcontractors back in the house.

| want to remind you that you have 30 days from June 6 to give me all applicable insurance information that

covers the damage your subcontractors already did and that would cover workers you might send to do
additional work. See https://law.justia.com/codes/georgia/2020/title-33/chapter-3/section-33-3-28/ .

-Wilhelmina

On Mon, Jun 6, 2022 at 10:16 AM Wilhelmina Randtke <randtke@gmail.com> wrote:
Brian,

Good morning. On Saturday, we'd come by and asked to see the license and insurance info for Floors
Outlet. | know you had said that you will not file a claim, because it will impact premiums, but could you still
provide the license information, so we can check on it?

Also, what is Caleb and Shannon's last name, or the name they are using to contract with you?

Thanks so much for any assistance.

-Wilhelmina
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Exhibit H2.

This is the image0.jpeg attachment to the June 21,
2022 email in the chain. This shows that P3 Flooring
purchased an insurance policy on June 18, 2022.

While Brian McDonald stated in the email that it was a
certificate of insurance for Floors Outlet, it does not
list Floors Outlet as covered.
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CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE iy

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisiens or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).
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COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.
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CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE

THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.
Wilhelmina Alexander

204 Highland Rd

Statesboro, GA 30458 AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE
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